
  BROTHERS, DEAR, 
 

WE’LL GATHER HERE: 

  

THE CAL BETA CHAPTER HOUSE 

BERKELEY, CALIFORNIA 

 

THURSDAY, DECEMBER 2, 2021 

 at 11:30 a.m. 
 

To celebrate the annual “Jack Leathers Christmas Reunion.” 

 

We are not returning to the Round Hill Country Club.  Thanks 
to the concerted efforts of the Leslie Family, we were 
provided with a date and time (Thursday, December 9th) of 
our choice.  However, the cost per attendee was $84.00 
compared to $40.00 in 2019.  The Fish Market in San Mateo 
could only provide seating for 12 at this time.  Jeff Koblick, 
chapter advisor, said he could provide everything we needed 
this year: a convenient location; free parking; good food and 
drink; all for less than $40.00.  It would also let everyone see 
the improvements that have been made in what was once our 
"home".  You are strongly encouraged to invite your wife 
and/or significant other to accompany you.  As of this date, it 

appears the following will be able to attend:       

       

Chuck Benjamin 

Will Classen 

Herb Dedo 

John Derdivanis 

Roger Durst 

Dave & Arlo Edwards 

Bob Farnam 

Mike Friedenbach 

Bruce & Trudi Garland 

Andy Gianulias 



Roy & Barbara Gustfason 

Jim Kidder 

Jeff Koblick 

Al & Barbara Kyte 

Bob & Carol Leslie 

Shel & Mona Onstead 

Jim & Kay Riewerts 

Alan & Pam Schmeiser 

Peter Van Houten & Nancy 

Doug Weiss 

 

Al Kyte '57 will be inducted into the Cal Beta Andy Smith Hall 
of Fame.  All-Conference baseball player and JV basketball 
starter, and a member of the Order of the Golden Bear, Al 
served as a naval officer for three years with the Marine 
Corps.  He then received his Master's and doctoral degrees 
at Cal while serving as an assistant baseball coach and as 
the administrator of Cal's physical activity progam.  He is a 
nationally-known expert on fly fishing and fly casting and 
received the International Federation of Fly Fishers award for 
teaching excellence 

 

If you have any questions or concerns, please e-mail me 
at jrk@unr.edu or call me at (775) 825-0708 in Reno. 
 

Phi Alpha, 
         

       Jim Kidder ’57  

 

mailto:jrk@unr.edu

